

EXHIBIT "C"

SITRICK AND COMPANY

MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT For the time period May 24, 2019 through June 30, 2019

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/24/2019	ADP	OH Daily Planning Call with D.Griffing, M. Montier; Dewey Square, The Ridge Group (.4); weekly external affairs call with D. Griffing, Dewey Square, The Ridge Group, J. Tucker (.7).	1.10	
6/3/2019	BA	Fielded media inquiries re: protests re: HB6. (.6) Email discussion re: NRC license transfer filing (.5).	1.10	
	TJB	Fielded and responded to media inquiry from Platts (.7); conferred with Akron Beacon Journal reporter regarding interview request and other matters (.5); made recommendations to J. Judge on same (.3); fielded media inquiries regarding NRC notice of license transfer and conferred with T. Lentz and D. Griffing on responses (1.2); fielded inquiry from Toledo Blade regarding certain protests and conferred with D. Griffing on response (.6); drafted and revised media statement (.5); calls and emails with reporter on same (.7).	4.50	
	ADP	Ohio Daily Planning Call with D. Griffing, M. Montier, Dewey Square. (.4)	0.40	
	KMS	Completed the daily FirstEnergy Solutions news search in Bloomberg, Google, Factiva, Politico Pro and other publications (2) Review, format/organize and disseminate articles to working group team (.5).	2.50	
6/4/2019	BA	Worked on retrieving information for Crain's reporter. (.7) Reached out to FES HR and L. Beckerman re: Employee STIP question that came into the Employee email box. (.8) Email exchange with J. Tucker re: capacity auction request. (.6) Worked with Cleveland.com to supply inquiry re: HB6 (1.3).	3.40	
	TJB	Discussed communications/media relations needs for Senate hearings (.4); fielded and responded to multiple media inquiries regarding NRC license transfer notice (4.1); fielded inquiries from Crain's on variety of issues (.4).	4.90	
	ADP	OH Daily Planning Call with D.Griffing; M. Montier; Dewey Square and Akin Group (.8); handled Crain's Inquiry (.4)	1.20	
	KMS	Completed the daily FirstEnergy Solutions news search in Bloomberg, Google, Factiva, Politico Pro and other publications (1.4) Review, format/organize and disseminate articles to working group team (.5).	1.90	
6/5/2019	BA	Participated in the Ohio legislation call with D. Griffing, J. DuBrois of Dewey, J. Tucker of Akin and rest of external affairs team. (.7) Reviewed PJM report. (1.3) Drafted FES statement to PJM report; revised per legal and management. (2.6) Fielded media inquiries including J. Beattie, J. Tomich of E&E News, provided FES statement (3.4).	8.00	

	TJB	Fielded and responded to multiple media inquiries regarding PJM report throughout the day (5.7); drafted and revised media statement on same (.4).	6.10
	ADP	OH Daily Planning Call (.6); provide Bloomberg reporter PJM statement (.1)	0.70
	KMS	Completed the daily FirstEnergy Solutions news search in Bloomberg, Google, Factiva, Politico Pro and other publications (2) Review, format/organize and disseminate articles to working group team (.5).	2.50
6/6/2019	TJB	Fielded and responded to inquiry from RTO Insider (.2); fielded and responded to inquiry from S&P Global (.2).	0.40
	ADP	Handled inquiry from Platts (.7); OH Daily Planning Call with D. Griffing; M. Montier; Dewey Square and Akin Group (.6)	1.30
	KMS	Completed the daily FirstEnergy Solutions news search in Bloomberg, Google, Factiva, Politico Pro and other publications (1.3) Review, format/organize and disseminate articles to working group team (.5)	1.80
6/7/2019	BA	Participated in External Affairs call with whole team both Ohio and PA - D. Griffing, M. Mortimer, J. Tucker of Akin, Juan Cepades.(.7) Continued working on media inquiries re: PJM report. (.7) Fielded media inquiry re: capacity issue at Beaver Valley plant, worked with M. Durbin on response. (.5) Received inquiry from Voice of America inviting FES to participate in on-air business forum (.3).	2.20
	TJB	Fielded and responded to media inquiry from Toledo Blade (.8); fielded and responded to media inquiry from Columbus Dispatch (.6); fielded and responded to media inquiry from E&E (.6).	2.00
	ADP	OH Daily Planning Call with D. Griffing; M.Montier; Dewey Square Capital and Akin Group. (.7); handled press inquiry from Platts (.3).	1.00
	KMS	Completed the daily FirstEnergy Solutions news search in Bloomberg, Google, Factiva, Politico Pro and other publications (1.3) Review, format/organize and disseminate articles to working group team (.5)	1.80
6/10/2019	BA	Participated in Ohio lobbying team meeting with D. Griffing, S. Burnazian. (.7) Fielded media inquiries re: HB6 (.4).	1.10
	TJB	Drafted and revised media statement (1.4); calls with D. Griffing and J. Drobis on legislative update and communications needs (.7); fielded and responded to media inquiries from S&P, Plain-Dealer, Fremont News-Messenger, and Pittsburgh Business Times (4.3).	6.40
	ADP	OH Daily Planning Call with D. Griffing; M. Montier; Dewey Square and Akin Group (.4)	0.40
6/10/2019	KMS	Completed the daily FirstEnergy Solutions news search in Bloomberg, Google, Factiva, Politico Pro and other publications (2) Review, format/organize and disseminate articles to working group team (.5).	2.50
6/11/2019	BA	Email discussion re: responding to negative blogger's inquiry. (.8) Discussion with J. Tucker re: possible release on auction permission to offer energy or not (1.1).	1.90

	TJB	Fielded and responded to inquiries from Bloomberg, S&P, Toledo Blade, and Energy Institute (3.7).	3.70
	ADP	OH Daily Planning Call with D. Griffing; M. Montier; Dewey Square and Akin (.6); sent media statement on PJM study to Industry Dive (.1)	0.70
	KMS	Completed the daily FirstEnergy Solutions news search in Bloomberg, Google, Factiva, Politico Pro and other publications (1.3). Review, format/organize and disseminate articles to working group team (.5).	1.80
6/12/2019	BA	Participated in Ohio lobbying team call with D. Griffing, J. DuBrois of Dewey Squared. (.6) Fielded media inquiries on timing of closure of the plants (.3).	0.90
	TJB	Conferred with D. Griffing, J. Judge, and others on blog post and potential response (.5).	0.50
	ADP	OH Daily Planning Call with D. Griffing; M. Monitor; Dewey Square and Akin Group (.8); follow up with Industry Dive reporter re: PJM study response (.3).	1.10
	KMS	Completed the daily FirstEnergy Solutions news search in Bloomberg, Google, Factiva, Politico Pro and other publications (2). Review, format/organize and disseminate articles to working group team (.5).	2.50
6/13/2019	TJB	Fielded and responded to media inquiries from Akron Beacon Journal, Crain's, Energy Institute, and Associated Press (4.7); calls with D. Benyak (.3) and T. Lentz (.3).	5.30
	ADP	OH Daily Planning Call with D. Griffing; M. Montier; Dewey Square and Akin Group (.6)	0.60
	KMS	Completed the daily FirstEnergy Solutions news search in Bloomberg, Google, Factiva, Politico Pro and other publications (2). Review, format/organize and disseminate articles to working group team (.5).	2.50
6/14/2019	BA	Fielded media inquiry from Argus Media re: refueling timing for Davis-Besse. (.7) Participated in External Affairs call with J. Tucker, D. Griffing, Dewey Squared and rest of team (.7) Read Sierra Club objection and discussion with T. Becker and A. Pruitt (.8)	2.20
	TJB	Fielded and responded to media inquiry regarding Sierra Club objection (1.6); reviewed related court documents (.4); conferred with A. Pruitt and B. Adrian on same (.1); fielded and responded to HB6 inquiry from WTOL (.3).	2.40
	ADP	OH Daily Planning call with D. Griffing; M. Montier; Dewey Square and Akin Group (.3) Sierra Club objection discussion (.1)	0.40
	KMS	Completed the daily FirstEnergy Solutions news search in Bloomberg, Google, Factiva, Politico Pro and other publications (1.3). Review, format/organize and disseminate articles to working group team (.5).	1.80

6/17/2019	BA	Fielded media inquiry from Argus Media re: timing for Davis-Besse refueling. (.3) Participated in discussion with D. Griffing, T. Becker and Dewey Squared team re: Energy and Policy.org inquiry re: FES employees working with Generation Now on getting Ohio to pass legislation for Nuclear plants. (.4) Discussion on coverage for Tuesday, 6/25 hearing re: Sierra Club motion, read motion, prep, (1.2) Discussion with B. Lin-Fisher of Akron Beacon Journal re: customer mailing that all received from "the court", discussed with Prime Clerk and received copy, responded to Betty's questions. (2.1) Participated in FES response in preparation of protest to HB6 in Bowling Green - for Toledo Blade (.4).	4.40
	TJB	Fielded and responded to media inquiries regarding Sierra Club motion (.4); timing of fuel purchase (.4); and status of HB6 (.3).	1.10
	ADP	OH Daily Planning Call with D. Griffing; M. Montier, Dewey Square and Akin Group (0.5)	0.50
	KMS	Completed the daily FirstEnergy Solutions news search in Bloomberg, Google, Factiva, Politico Pro and other publications (1.3). Review, format/organize and disseminate articles to working group team (.5).	1.80
6/18/2019	TJB	Calls and emails with J. Pelzer of Cleveland Plain-Dealer (1.2); calls with D. Griffing, J. Tucker and team on same (1.5); drafted and revised responses (1.7).	4.40
	ADP	OH Daily Planning Call with Dave Griffing, M. Montier, Dewey Square and Akin Group (.5)	0.50
	KMS	Completed the daily FirstEnergy Solutions news search in Bloomberg, Google, Factiva, Politico Pro and other publications (1.6). Review, format/organize and disseminate articles to working group team (.5).	2.10
6/19/2019	BA	Worked with J. Young and M. Durbin re: Supreme Court order removing FE Incentives. Discussion with D. Griffing re: same. FES no pro-active response, only respond if contacted because it is a Corp. issue. (2.3) Responded to S. DiSavino of Reuters inquiry re: Gov. Wolf of PA stance on carbon-free energy generating. Discussion with D. Griffing, Provided response to DiSavino. (1.3) Discussion with J. Young re: Energy News Network, K. Kowalski re: Ash pond questions, reached out to in-house content provider. (.4) Fielded inquiry from WV Public Broadcasting re: ACE rule being finalized on 6/19 (.6).	4.60
	TJB	Fielded and responded to multiple media inquiries throughout the day from Plain-Dealer (.6); Fremont News Messenger (1.1); Beacon Journal (2.2); NPR (1.3); and various other news outlets (2.5).	7.70
6/19/2019	ADP	OH Daily Planning Call (.4); confer with T. Becker and B. Adrian on media inquiries (.7)	1.10
	KMS	Completed the daily FirstEnergy Solutions news search in Bloomberg, Google, Factiva, Politico Pro and other publications (2.0). Review, format/organize and disseminate articles to working group team (.5).	2.50

6/20/2019	BA	Worked on corrections re: FE Corp Incentives stories that erroneously included FES. Identified errors, worked with T. Becker and A. Pruitt to reach out to reporters to ask for corrections, or at least educate them for the future (1.3).	1.30
	TJB	Fielded and responded to inquiries from RTO Insider (1.2); Cleveland Plain-Dealer (.4); Reuters (.6); and Bloomberg (.5).	2.70
	ADP	Worked with T. Becker and B. Adrian to reach out to reporters to ask for corrections (.6).	0.60
	KMS	Completed the daily FirstEnergy Solutions news search in Bloomberg, Google, Factiva, Politico Pro and other publications (2.0). Review, format/organize and disseminate articles to working group team (.5).	2.50
6/21/2019	BA	Participated in External Affairs call with D. Griffing, Chris Curry of Dewey Squared, J. Tucker of Akin and entire lobbying team. (.8) Media check on possible corrections requested. (.7) Discussion with D. Griffing re: upcoming communication activities and coverage of hearings, protests, and other issues. (.5) Participated in ongoing discussion of request from Plain Dealer for financials to disprove the API report re: profitability of the plants (1.7).	3.70
	ADP	OH Daily Planning Call (.6).	0.60
	KMS	Completed the daily FirstEnergy Solutions news search in Bloomberg, Google, Factiva, Politico Pro and other publications (2.0). Review, format/organize and disseminate articles to working group team (.5).	2.50
6/23/2019	BA	Participated in conference call with J. Kiani, D. Griffing and Dewey group re: Jeremy Pelzer of Plain Dealer response for "providing financials" to prove the Plants are unprofitable. (.4)	0.40
	TJB	Call with J. Judge regarding media issues (.2); calls with D. Griffing regarding media issues (.7); drafted and revised media statements (1.4); reviewed media questions and conferred with D. Griffing on responses (1.5).	3.80
6/24/2019	BA	Fielded media inquiry forwarded from J. Young at FE Corp from K. Kowalski at Energy News Network. Discussion with D. Griffing, A. Lubich and J. Bellingham re: response re: Coal ash ponds. Responded with information requested. (2.1) Participated in email discussion of question of profitability from various media outlets. (.5) Interim communications discussion with D. Griffing and P. Greene of A&M for continued planning of separation of the companies. (.7)	3.30
	TJB	Traveled to Akron to attend court hearing (5.8). Travel billed at half rate.	5.80
	ADP	Ohio Daily Planning Call with D. Griffing, M. Montler; Dewey Square and Akin Group (.6); communications management call with B. Adrian; Pat Greene, Connor Davis; Dave Griffing and Heather Robinson (.8)	1.40
	KMS	Completed the daily FirstEnergy Solutions news search in Bloomberg, Google, Factiva, Politico Pro and other publications (2) Review, format/organize and disseminate articles to working group team (.5)	2.50

6/25/2019	TJB	Attended court hearing (1.4); fielded and responded to media inquiries related to court hearing (.8); fielded and responded to media inquiries related to HB6 status (1.4); conferred with D Griffing on communications plan for June 30 deadline (.6); began working on related materials (1.2).	5.80
	TJB	Traveled Akron to NY (6.1). Travel billed at half rate.	6.10
	ADP	Ohio Daily Planning Call with D. Griffing, M. Montler; Dewey Square and Akin Group (.3)	0.30
	KMS	Completed the daily FirstEnergy Solutions news search in Bloomberg, Google, Factiva, Politico Pro and other publications (2) Review, format/organize and disseminate articles to working group team (.5)	2.50
6/26/2019	BA	Read over summary of augmented HB6. (.6) Worked on statement in response of revised bill. Various discussions with D. Griffing and mgmt. team re: whether a response is necessary.(1.3) Fielded media inquires on new additions to HB6. (.7) Discussion of upcoming communication needs if decision is made not to refuel Davis Besse. (.7) Follow-up with K. Kowalski of Energy News Network. (.4)	3.70
	TJB	Fielded and responded to media inquiries and interview requests related to HB6 issues (4.5).	4.50
	ADP	Ohio Daily Planning Call with D. Griffing, M. Montler; Dewey Square and Akin Group (.3); drafted media statement on HB6; conferred with B. Adrian and T. Becker on same (.4)	0.70
	KMS	Completed the daily FirstEnergy Solutions news search in Bloomberg, Google, Factiva, Politico Pro and other publications (2) Review, format/organize and disseminate articles to working group team (.5)	2.50
6/27/2019	BA	Fielded media inquiry from P. Zernank of Argus media; responded with appropriate statement. (.6) Worked with D. Griffing on employee update for possible extension of vote on HB6; various editing and discussions. (2.3) Conference call with S. Burnazian re: messaging for decision on refueling Davis Besse; revised messaging accordingly. (1.4) Revised version of media statement and letter to employees. (1.8)	6.10
	TJB	Fielded and responded to media inquiries throughout the day regarding status of legislation and company plans (6.7); worked on related communications materials (.7).	7.40
	ADP	Ohio Daily Planning Call with D. Griffing, M. Montler; Dewey Square and Akin Group (.6); review Employee Memo; confer with T.Becker and B. Adrian on same (.2); call with T. Becker, Dave Griffing; Stephen Burnazian on HB6 response (.7)	1.50
	KMS	Completed the daily FirstEnergy Solutions news search in Bloomberg, Google, Factiva, Politico Pro and other publications (2) Review, format/organize and disseminate articles to working group team (.5)	2.50

6/28/2019	BA	Worked with A. Pruitt on rollout strategy for July 1 (.7) Continued working on letter and media statement. (1.8) Revised rollout plan with A. Pruitt as mgmt. made changes throughout day. (1.4) Continued discussing possible media "leaks" to specific reporters and not a press release for Monday. (.9)	4.80	
	TJB	Fielded and responded to media inquiries on legislation status and company plans (2.7); revised communications materials (1.1); calls with D. Griffing and S. Burnazian on same (.4).	4.20	
	ADP	OH Daily Planning Call (.6); Drafted, reviewed and edited communications documents; calls with David Griffing and Stephen Burnazian on same and conferred with B. Adrian and T. Becker on communications documents and media inquiries (7)	7.60	
	KMS	Completed the daily FirstEnergy Solutions news search in Bloomberg, Google, Factiva, Politico Pro and other publications (2) Review, format/organize and disseminate articles to working group team (.5)	2.50	
6/29/2019	BA	Continued revising announcement documents. Discussion re: timing and rollout of all communications. (2.6)	2.60	
	TJB	Drafted and revised press release drafts and related media statements (3.2); calls and texts with D. Griffing and S. Burnazian on same (1.3); responded to media inquiries (.4).	4.90	
	ADP	OH Daily Planning Call with Dave Griffing, Murphy Montier, Akin Group and Dewey Square (.2); call with Stephen Burnazian, Dave Griffing and B. Adrian to discuss communications roll out plan (.5); edited communications roll out plan and conferred with B. Adrian and T. Becker on same (.9)	1.60	
6/30/2019	TJB	Revised press release (.4); revised employee memo (.3).	0.70	
	ADP	OH Daily Planning Call (.3); Edited multiple versions of refueling deadline release; confer with B. Adrian and T. Becker on same (2)	2.20	
	KMS	Reviewed, coordinated and set up the FES HB6 press release for distribution over PRN's newswire service.	1.00	
	CBW	First Energy masthead template edit.	0.50	
TOTAL TIME CHARGES			225.50	\$110,683.75

EXPENSES

Qty/Price

AIRFARE

6/24/2019	Corniche Delta Airlines Date of Travel: June 24, 2019 Tom Becker	1 \$648.30	648.30
6/25/2019	Corniche Delta Airlines Date of Travel: June 25, 2019 Tom Becker	1 \$613.30	613.30

SUBTOTAL:

[1,261.60]

CONFERENCE CALLS

5/31/2019	Adigo April 2019 Brenda Adrian	1 \$9.71	9.71
-----------	--------------------------------------	-------------	------

SUBTOTAL:

[9.71]

GROUND TRANSPORTATION

6/24/2019	Expense Report Tom Becker 06/24/2019 Hertz ECL Invoice Number: 118456 Date of Service: 06/24/2019 Tom Becker	1 \$202.78	202.78
6/25/2019	ECL Invoice Number: 118456 Date of Service: 06/25/2019 Tom Becker	1 \$200.28	200.28

SUBTOTAL:

[600.64]

LODGING

6/24/2019	Expense Report Tom Becker 06/24/2019 Aloft	1 \$257.84	257.84
-----------	---	---------------	--------

SUBTOTAL:

[257.84]

MEALS

5/31/2019	Expense Report	1	8.73
	Tom Becker	\$8.73	
	05/20/2019		
	Cibo Express		
	Expense Report	1	15.05
	Tom Becker	\$15.05	
	05/20/2019		
	Wow Bao		
6/24/2019	Expense Report	1	36.89
	Tom Becker	\$36.89	
	06/24/2019		
	Barley House		
6/25/2019	Expense Report	1	9.20
	Tom Becker	\$9.20	
	06/25/2019		
	Starbucks		
	Expense Report	1	15.05
	Tom Becker	\$15.05	
	06/25/2019		
	Wow Bao		

SUBTOTAL:

[84.92]

OTHER

6/1/2019	Politico Pro Service	1	7,000.00
	Invoice # SIN034618	\$7,000.00	
	06/01/2019-05/31/2020		
6/30/2019	Quarles & Brady	1	1,586.80
	Invoice # 6154300	\$1,586.80	
	June 2019		

SUBTOTAL:

[8,586.80]

PARKING

6/25/2019	Expense Report	1	5.00
	Tom Becker	\$5.00	
	06/25/2019		
	High & Market Garage		

SUBTOTAL:

[5.00]

RESEARCH (DATA BASE)

6/1/2019 E&E News	1	1,000.00
Energywire	\$1,000.00	
Invoice# 476305		
Installment 3 of 3		

SUBTOTAL: [1,000.00]

TOTAL ADDITIONAL CHARGES \$11,806.51