

EXHIBIT "C"

SITRICK AND COMPANY

MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT

For the time period

August 31, 2018 through September 30, 2018

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/31/2018	KMS	Assisted R. Chhetri with retrieving the subscription-only Kallanish Energy Daily News & Analysis article: "FES to close all coal-fired & nuclear power plants" for FES client dissemination. (.1)	0.10	
9/3/2018	BA	Email discussion re: residential customer accounts being transferred in sale and how Customer Service center will handle calls. (.3)	0.30	
	TSM	Review emails from B. Farley, D. Botter on early-termination penalties for retail contracts, and confer by email with B. Adrian on same (.5)	0.70	
9/4/2018	BA	Participated in call related to handling customers requesting to cancel accounts according to terms of current account prior to transfer to Constellation. (1.2) Responded to Betty Lin-Fisher of the Akron Beacon Journal re: copy of the customer letter looking to clarify Constellation's relation to Exelon. Emails to resolved issue. (.9) Handled incoming call re: Caller from Industrial Assets Group calling for information regarding purchasing the fossil assets. Ultimately passed to Lazard. (.4)	2.50	
	RC	Media search in Google, Factiva, Politico Pro. Bloomberg and other top publications in Ohio (1.7) Review and coordinate articles (.5) Send to entire group and maintain media clip list (.3)	2.60	
	TSM	Participate in phone conference with T. Alexander, Z. Wittenberg, B. Farley, B. Adrian re: policy on early-termination penalties (1); field query from ClimateWire re: last week's fossil deactivation announcement (.3); review news coverage (.4).	1.70	
	TSM	Travel (car, plane, taxi) from NY home to Cleveland hotel. Billed at half hourly rate.	5.20	
9/5/2018	RC	Media search in Google, Factiva, Politico Pro. Bloomberg and other top publications in Ohio (1.2) Review and coordinate articles (.6) Send to entire group and maintain media clip list (.1)	1.90	
	TSM	Revise R. Cordray letter and circulate to team (.2); confer with D. Moul, D. Griffing re: Crain's editorial board meeting (.5); participate in editorial board meeting at Crain's Cleveland with Moul, Griffing (1.1); review news coverage (.4)	2.20	

9/5/2018	TSM	Travel (taxi, plane, car) from Cleveland hotel to NY home (5.2) Billed at half hourly rate.	5.20
9/6/2018	RC	Media search in Google, Factiva, Politico Pro. Bloomberg and other top publications in Ohio (1.2) Review and coordinate articles (.6) Send to entire group and maintain media clip list (.1)	1.90
	TSM	Exchange email with J. Tucker, D. Griffing re: E&E News story with bad headline (.4); exchange email on same with E&E News reporter and editors (.8); review news coverage (.4); take query from Energy Daily re: OVEC issue (.5)	2.10
9/7/2018	BA	Participated in External Affairs call. (.8) Reviewed questions to the Employee email box and drafted Employee Update FAQ. Circulated and edited per comments received. (2.4) Email discussion re: addressing Employee question re: Paul Harden's statement in the KERP hearing re: Union employees not needed to run the plants, which was printed in the Cleveland Plain Dealer. (.5)	3.90
	RC	Media search in Google, Factiva, Politico Pro. Bloomberg and other top publications in Ohio (1.7) Review and coordinate articles (.3) Send to entire group and maintain media clip list (.1)	2.10
	TSM	Review news coverage (.4); take query from WEWS-TV Cleveland on sale of retail book; review email from team on Ch 11 bar date (.3); exchange email with team on employee question re: P. Harden KERP testimony and review transcripts on same (1.5)	2.20
9/10/2018	RC	Media search in Google, Factiva, Politico Pro. Bloomberg and other top publications in Ohio (1.8) Review and coordinate articles (.4) Send to entire group and maintain media clip list (.3)	2.50
	TSM	Exchange emails with team re: employee question on P. Harden KERP testimony, review more transcripts and draft possible response (2); review news coverage (.4); review and edit Employee Update (.3); exchange email with T. Lentz re: upcoming submission to NRC on deactivation (.5); exchange email with J. Drobis re: agenda, conference call on OCEJA launch (.2)	3.40
9/11/2018	RC	Media search in Google, Factiva, Politico Pro. Bloomberg and other top publications in Ohio (.9) Review and coordinate articles (.3) Send to entire group and maintain media clip list (.1)	1.30
	TSM	Take query from Debtwire on fossil deactivation, EPA's ACE plan (.8); review news coverage (.3); exchange email with D. Moul, B. Adrian & team on K. Warvell transition (.5)	1.60

9/12/2018	BA	Participated in conference call with Dewey Squared team: J. Drobis, J. Adler and C. Curry re: launch of the coalition and activities surrounding the Oct. 10th date. Discussed how Sitrick PR team will interact with Clean Energy Jobs Alliance PR person when he comes on board. (.7)	0.70
	RC	Media search in Google, Factiva, Politico Pro. Bloomberg and other top publications in Ohio (1.2) Review and coordinate articles (.3) Send to entire group and maintain media clip list (.2)	1.70
9/12/2018	TSM	Review news coverage (.4); participate in conference call re: coalition media plan (.5)	0.90
9/13/2018	BA	Participated in weekly External Affairs call with External Affairs team - J. Tucker (lead for Ex Aff team from Akin), H. Terhune of Akin. B. Farley, K. Mizer of FES and Brian Colbert of A&M. Navigant team presented a synopsis of recently completed study on "Cost of Doing Nothing." (.6) Discussion re: Beaver County pipeline explosion, energy watch in the Carolinas during upcoming hurricane and key upcoming dates. (.5)	1.10
	RC	Media search in Google, Factiva, Politico Pro. Bloomberg and other top publications in Ohio (1.5) Review and coordinate articles (.5) Send to entire group and maintain media clip list (.2)	2.20
	TSM	Participate in External Affairs Working Group conference call (.7); review news coverage (.5); confer with R. Chhetri on special news feed on Beaver County pipeline explosion and edit same (.7); field call from Toledo Blade reporter on Sept 14 objection deadline for retail customers (.5)	2.40
9/14/2018	BA	Participated in a portion of the External Affairs weekly call. (.5) Email discussion re: Union lawyer request for clarification of Employee Update FAQ regarding possible confusion about CBA succession language not included in answer. (.3) Email discussion with T.Mulligan and D. Benyak re: follow-up request from International Joint Commission fellow on obtaining photos, other information on Perry & D-B plants for Great Lakes environment impact study. (1.2)	1.50
	RC	Media search in Google, Factiva, Politico Pro. Bloomberg and other top publications in Ohio (1.7) Review and coordinate articles (.3) Send to entire group and maintain media clip list (.2)	2.20
	TSM	Exchange email with D. Benyak, B. Adrian re: follow-up request from International Joint Commission fellow on obtaining photos, other information on Perry & D-B plants for Great Lakes environment impact study (1.5); review news on Mass. gas explosions and confer with R. Chhetri on adding articles to news list (.7); review news coverage (.4)	2.60

9/17/2018	RC	Media search in Google, Factiva, Politico Pro. Bloomberg and other top publications in Ohio (1.2) Review and coordinate articles (.3) Send to entire group and maintain media clip list (.2)	1.70
	TSM	Review news coverage (.3); exchange emails with Reuters reporter re: story on status of coal plants, and confer on same thru day with D. Griffing, team (2)	2.30
9/18/2018	BA	Discussion with T. Mulligan re: question on Sept. 13 Employee Update. (.2)	0.20
	RC	Media search in Google, Factiva, Politico Pro. Bloomberg and other top publications in Ohio (.8) Review and coordinate articles (.2) Send to entire group and maintain media clip list (.1)	1.10
9/18/2018	TSM	Review email from D. Hamilton re: Sept 13 Employee Update and confer on same with B. Adrian (.3); exchange emails with R. Borland re: story by UX Weekly erroneously reporting emergence from Chapter 11 (.6); exchange email with Ux Weekly editor on same (.4); exchange email with Toledo Blade reporter on sale of retail book (.3); review news coverage (.4); exchange email with team re: court's decision not to approve KERP, and prepare drafts of media statement and Employee Update on same (2.5); exchange email and phone calls with Cleveland Plain Dealer reporter re: Kerp (.5)	5.00
9/19/2018	BA	Email discussion with L. Herf, Baker Hofstetter (External Affairs team) re: BK court denial of KERP motion. (.3) Worked with T. Mulligan re: media inquiry on the KERP denial. (.3)	0.60
	RC	Media search in Google, Factiva, Politico Pro. Bloomberg and other top publications in Ohio (1.4) Review and coordinate articles (.3) Send to entire group and maintain media clip list (.2)	1.90
	TSM	Exchange emails with team finalizing Employee Update and media statement on Tuesday KERP ruling (2); forward Employee Update and media statement to FE Corp. PR (.2); field queries on KERP ruling from Beaver County Times, E&E News and respond with media statement (.6); review news coverage (.4)	3.20
9/20/2018	BA	Email discussion with T. Mulligan re: KERP questions from The Deal (.3); review news coverage (.4)	0.70
	RC	Media search in Google, Factiva, Politico Pro. Bloomberg and other top publications in Ohio (1.4) Review and coordinate articles (.3) Send to entire group and maintain media clip list (.2)	1.90
	TSM	Review news coverage (.3); exchange email with B .Adrian re: query on KERP ruling from The Deal (.4); confer by phone with D. Griffing on T. Becker joining team (.2)	0.90

9/21/2018	BA	Responded to media inquiry from S. Gleason of The Deal re: BK court denial of KERP plan. (.7) Participated in the External Affairs weekly call. (.6) communications team strategy meeting re: upcoming event/open issues (.9)	2.20
	TJB	Conferred with team on communications strategy and upcoming events/issues for planning purposes (1.5).(NO CHARGE)	1.50
	RC	Media search in Google, Factiva, Politico Pro. Bloomberg and other top publications in Ohio (1.7) Review and coordinate articles (.3) Send to entire group and maintain media clip list (.2)	2.20
	TSM	Participate in EA Working Group conference call (.8); review news coverage (.4); communications team strategy meeting re: upcoming event/open issues (.9)	2.10
9/24/2018	RC	Media search in Google, Factiva, Politico Pro. Bloomberg and other top publications in Ohio (1.7) Review and coordinate articles (.3) Send to entire group and maintain media clip list (.2)	2.20
	TSM	Review news coverage (.3)	0.30
9/25/2018	RC	Media search in Google, Factiva, Politico Pro. Bloomberg and other top publications in Ohio (1) Review and coordinate articles (.3) Send to entire group and maintain media clip list (.2)	1.50
	TSM	Review news coverage (.3); field query from IXH Energy Daily re: filings from US, Ohio & Penn and review filings (1)	1.30
9/26/2018	BA	Managed the editing process of the KERP Employee Update with the approval group, L. Beckerman, D. Moul, D. Griffing, Lauren Leyden and Raymond Lieb. Finalized approved language into appropriate format with masthead. (1.3)	1.30
	RC	Media search in Google, Factiva, Politico Pro. Bloomberg and other top publications in Ohio (.8) Review and coordinate articles (.2) Send to entire group and maintain media clip list (.1)	1.10
9/26/2018	TSM	Exchange email with B. Adrian, L. Beckerman, D. Moul, team on Employee Update re: next steps on KERP (.5); write Employee Update on KERP and circulated to team (1.5); confer by phone with D. Moul (.2); review news coverage (.4)	2.60
	KMS	Covered the research and compilation of the daily FES news search for R. Chhetri and circulated to the news distribution list on 9/26/18. (.8)	0.80

9/27/2018	RC	Media search in Google, Factiva, Politico Pro. Bloomberg and other top publications in Ohio (1.8) Review and coordinate articles (.4) Send to entire group and maintain media clip list (.2)	2.40	
	TSM	Review news coverage (.4)	0.40	
9/28/2018	BA	Participated in discussion re: answer for extension to retail business sale. (.4)	0.40	
	RC	Media search in Google, Factiva, Politico Pro. Bloomberg and other top publications in Ohio (1.4) Review and coordinate articles (.3) Send to entire group and maintain media clip list (.2)	1.90	
	TSM	Field call from Cleveland Plain Dealer, discussing sale of retail book and upcoming editorial board meeting (.5); confer with B. Adrian, L. Beckerman, D. Botter, D. Griffing, B. Farley re: Plain Dealer query and respond to reporter (.4); review news coverage (.4)	1.30	
9/28/2018	ADP	External Affairs Call (.6)	0.60	
TOTAL TIME CHARGES			104.30	\$44,866.00

EXPENSES

Qty/Price

GROUND TRANSPORTATION

9/4/2018	ECL	Invoice Number: 101970 Date of Service: 09/04/2018 Tom Mulligan	1 \$234.10	234.10
		Expense Report Tom Mulligan 09/04/2018 Renaissance	1 \$36.00	36.00
9/5/2018	ECL	Invoice Number: 101970 Date of Service: 09/05/2018 Tom Mulligan	1 \$276.69	276.69
		Expense Report Tom Mulligan 09/05/2018 GCRTA	1 \$2.50	2.50
SUBTOTAL:			[549.29]	

LODGING

9/5/2018	Expense Report Tom Mulligan 09/05/2018 Renaissance Hotel	1 \$333.19	333.19
SUBTOTAL:			[333.19]

MEALS

9/4/2018	Expense Report	1	27.40
	Tom Mulligan	\$27.40	
	09/04/2018		
	Camden Market		
9/5/2018	Expense Report	1	18.00
	Tom Mulligan	\$18.00	
	09/05/2018		
	Quaker Steak		
	Expense Report	1	9.50
	Tom Mulligan	\$9.50	
	09/05/2018		
	Phoenix Coffee		

SUBTOTAL: **[54.90]**

OTHER

9/30/2018	Quarles & Brady	1	5,014.36
	Invoice # 6085262	\$5,014.36	
	September 2018		

SUBTOTAL: **[5,014.36]**

TOTAL ADDITIONAL CHARGES: **\$5,951.74**